
bring his over-mighty earl to heel.  Archbishop Robert accused Godwin 
of plotting to kill the king, just as he had killed his brother Alfred in 
1036, while Leofric and Siward supported the king and called up their 
vassals.  Sweyn and Harold called up their own vassals, but neither side 
wanted a fight, and Godwin and Sweyn appear to have each given a son 
as hostage, who were sent to Normandy.  The Godwins’ position  
disintegrated as their men were not willing to fight the king.  When 
Stigend, who was acting as intermediary, conveyed the king’s jest that 
Godwin could have his peace if he could restore Alfred and his  
companions alive and well, Godwin and his sons fled, going to Flanders 
and Ireland.  Edward repudiated Edith and sent her to a nunnery,  
perhaps because she was childless, and Archbishop Robert urged her 
divorce. 
 
 Sweyn went on pilgrimage to Jerusalem (dying on his way back), 
but Godwin and his other sons returned with an army following a year 
later, and received considerable support, while Leofric and Siward failed 
to support the king.  Both sides were concerned that a civil war would 
leave the country open to foreign invasion.  The king was furious, but he 
was forced to give way and restore Godwin and Harold to their  
earldoms, while Robert of Jumierges and other Frenchmen fled, fearing 
Godwin’s vengeance.  Edith was restored as queen, and Stigand, who 
had again acted as an intermediary between the two sides in the crisis, 
was appointed Archbishop of Canterbury in Robert’s place.  Stigand  
retained his existing bishopric of Winchester, and his pluralism was to 
be a continuing source of dispute with the pope.  Edward’s nephew, Earl 
Ralph, who had been one of his chief supporters in the crisis of 1051-52, 
may have received Sweyn’s marcher earldom of Hereford at this time.  
                                                                                              *(excerpted from:  www.catholic.org://wikipedia.org) 
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Saint Edward 
 

 *Edward the Confessor was the son of King Ethelred III and his 

Norman wife, Emma, daughter of Duke Richard I of Normandy.  He was 

born at Islip, England, and sent to Normandy with his mother in the 

year 1013 when the Danes under Sweyn and his son Canute invaded 

England.  Canute remained in England and the year after Etherlred’s 

death in 1016, married Emma, who had returned to England, and  

became King of England.  Edward remained in Normandy, was brought 

up a Norman, and in 1042, on the death of his half-brother,  

Hardicanute, son of Canute and Emma, and largely through the support 

of the powerful Earl Godwin, he was acclaimed king of England.  In 

1044, he married Godwin’s daughter Edith.  His reign was a peaceful 

one characterized by his good rule and remission of odious taxes, but 

also by the struggle, partly caused by his natural inclination to favor the 

Normans, between Godwin and his Saxon supporters and the Norman 

barons, including Robert of Jumieges, whom Edward had brought with 

him when he returned to England and whom he named Archbishop of 

Canterbury  in 1051. 

 

 In the same year, Edward banished Godwin, who took refuge in 

Flanders but returned the following year with a fleet ready to lead a 

rebellion.   Armed revolt was avoided when the two men met and 

settled their differences; among them was the Archbishop of  

Canterbury, which was resolved when Edward replaced Robert with  

Stigand, and Robert returned to Normandy.  Edward’s  

difficulties continued after Godwin’s death in 1053 with  

Godwin’s two sons:  Harold who had his eye on the throne 

since Edward was childless, and Tostig, Earl of Northumbria.  

Tostig was driven from Northumbria by a revolt in 1065 and 

banished to Europe by Edward, who named Harold his  

successor.  After this Edward became more interested in  

religious affairs and built St. Peter’s Abbey at Westminster, the 

site of the present Abbey, where he is buried.  His piety gained 

him the surname "the Confessor".  He died in London on  

January 5, and he was canonized in 1161 by Pope Alexander III.  

His feast day is October 13. 

 

The Crisis of 1051-1052 

 In ecclesiastical appointments, Edward and his advisers 

showed a bias against candidates with local connections, and 

when the clergy and monks of Canterbury elected a relative of 

Godwin as Archbishop of Canterbury in 1051, Edward rejected 

him and appointed Robert of Jumièges, who claimed that  

Godwin was in illegal possession of some archiepiscopal  

estates.  In September Edward was visited by his brother-in-

law, Godgifu’s second husband, Eustace, count of Boulogne.  

His men caused an affray in Dover, and Edward ordered  

Godwin as earl of Kent to punish the town’s burgesses, but he 

took their side and refused.   Edward seized the chance to  


